EXHIBIT 1

Case 1:16-cv-01730-SKO Document 88-5 Filed 07/14/23 Page 2 of 3

Date	Hours	Description	User
11/13/2022		Review papers in preparation for drafting motion for summary adjudication	Adrian Barnes
11/14/2022		Legal research regarding motion for partial summary judgment	Adrian Barnes
11/16/2022		Draft motion for partial summary judgment; conference with Craig Ackermann regarding same	Adrian Barnes
11/28/2022	0.1	AB read Bill email re: dismiss RB claim in the pending Martinez case and file a joint or unopposed motion for reconsideration of the Prelim App Motion based on Valiente;	Adrian Barnes
11/30/2022	0.1	AB read OPC email re: Defendant is agreeable to working together and resubmitting the motion for preliminary approval.;	Adrian Barnes
11/30/2022	0.1	AB read Bill email re: Call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/01/2022	0.1	AB read OPC email re: Available time for a call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/01/2022		AB read Jaclyn email re: Bills' available time for a call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/01/2022		AB send JH email re: available time for a call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/01/2022			
	0.1	AB read Jaclyn email re: Request availability for a call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/02/2022		AB send Jaclyn email re: availability for a call to address courts concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/02/2022	0.1	AB read Jaclyn email re: agreed date and time to discuss court concerns;	Adrian Barnes
12/05/2022	0.9	Conference with Richard Rahm and Craig Ackermann regarding renewed motion for preliminary approval.	Adrian Barnes
12/05/2022	0.1	AB read Bill email re: AB to draft a renewed motion for preliminary approval which will include a reconsideration request in light of Swift v. Valiente;	Adrian Barnes
12/15/2022	5.6	Draft renewed motion for preliminary approval	Adrian Barnes
12/16/2022			Adrian Barnes
		Draft renewed motion for preliminary approval	
12/17/2022		Draft renewed motion for preliminary approval	Adrian Barnes
12/18/2022		Draft renewed motion for preliminary approval and supporting papers	Adrian Barnes
12/20/2022		AB email x7 with co-counsel re:consider moving to revoke our agreement to the magistrate + edits re Notice of Motion and opposed renewed Motion;	Adrian Barnes
12/21/2022	0.2	AB email x4 with co-counsel re: attached Revised draft of Plaintiff's Notice of Motion and opposed renewed Motion + HL to drafts the declarations and finding the professional	Adrian Barnes
01/03/2023	0.1	finalize the brief given our firm's lodestar on the matter; AB read co-counsel email re: Request for update on the status of the preliminary approval motion;	Adrian Barnes
01/03/2023	0.1	AB send co-counsel email re: Drafting the memorandum ready to send to OPC + draft/edit the declaration after.	Adrian Barnes
01/04/2023		Draft motion for preliminary approval; draft declaration of Robert Martinez; draft proposed order	Adrian Barnes
01/04/2023		AB email x2 with co-counsel re: Co-counsel's total lodestar for the case from the beginning up until December 3, 2018 (the date class certification was	Adrian Barnes
01/04/2023	0.1	re entail x2 with occurring the beginning up until November 10, 2021;	Aunan Barries
01/05/2023	0.1	AB send OPC email re: attached draft renewed motion and memo for preliminary approval.	Adrian Barnes
01/05/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: Reviewing attached draft renewed motion and memo for preliminary approval.	Adrian Barnes
01/13/2023	0.1	AB send OPC email re: follow up OPC's thought on the preliminary approval brief;	Adrian Barnes
01/17/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: Edits / Approved preliminary approval brief;	Adrian Barnes
01/18/2023	1.6	Review edits to preliminary approval papers from opposing counsel; draft supporting declarations	Adrian Barnes
01/18/2023	0.1	AB send OPC email re: Reviewed / Approved preliminary approval brief;	Adrian Barnes
01/19/2023	0.9	Conference with Plaintiff regarding his declaration in support of renewed motion for preliminary approval; revise draft declaration	Adrian Barnes
01/23/2023	3.4	Revise papers in support of renewed motion for preliminary approval	Adrian Barnes
01/24/2023		Revise and finalize motion and papers for renewed motion for preliminary approval	Adrian Barnes
01/24/2023		AB read Bill email re: No objections re attached documents for the renewed motion for preliminary approval;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: Comments re attached documents for the renewed motion for preliminary approval;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023		AB send OPC email re: editing attached documents for the renewed motion for preliminary approval;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023	0.1	AB send Bill email re: signing attached documents for the renewed motion for preliminary approval for Bill and filing;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023		AB read Bill email re: signing and filing attached documents for the renewed motion for preliminary approval;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023		AB send Bill email re: signing and filing preliminary approval docs;	Adrian Barnes
01/25/2023	0.1	AB read Bill email re: signing and filing preliminary approval docs;	Adrian Barnes
01/27/2023	0.1	AB read AC email re: attached Proof of Service;	Adrian Barnes
01/27/2023	0.1	AB send AC email re: edits re Proof of Service;	Adrian Barnes
01/27/2023	0.1	AB send AC email re: attached preliminary approval docs for filling;	Adrian Barnes
01/30/2023	0.1	AB read AC email re: attached word version of the [Proposed] Order Granting Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement, filed;	Adrian Barnes
02/17/2023	0.1	AB read AC email re: attached Order re supplemental briefing;	Adrian Barnes
02/17/2023	0.1	AB read co-counsel email re: attached Order re supplemental briefing;	Adrian Barnes
02/17/2023		AB read Bill email re: contacting OPC to see if they will agree to limit the release with extra language the judge wants;	Adrian Barnes
02/21/2023	0.3	AB email with Bill, OPC re: proposed new language for settlement agreement; drafting and circulating an Addendum to the Settlement Agreement for the	Adrian Barnes
,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	0.0	parties' and lawyers signatures	sa. Danos
02/23/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: attached class action settlement agreement and stipulation;	Adrian Barnes
02/23/2023	0.1	AB read Bill email re: contacting client for signature re class action settlement agreement and stipulation;	Adrian Barnes
02/23/2023	0.1	AB send Bill email re: contacting client for signature re class action settlement agreement and stipulation;	Adrian Barnes
02/25/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: attached Martinez Settlement Agreement Signature Page;	Adrian Barnes
02/27/2023	0.4	Call to Plaintiff re: amended settlement; draft email to Plaintiff re: amended settlement	Adrian Barnes
02/28/2023	0.4	Conference with plaintiff regarding amendments to settlement agreement	
02/20/2023	0.4		Adrian Barnes
00/00/0000		AB send OPC email re: attached plaintiff's signature; drafting supplemental brief;	Adrian Barnes
02/28/2023		Port and an additional and a few and a few few flat for a few and a few flat flat flat flat flat flat flat flat	Autotom D
03/06/2023	1.2	Draft supplemental brief in support of renewed motion for preliminary approval; draft email to co-counsel regarding same	Adrian Barnes
03/06/2023 03/06/2023	1.2	AB send AC, JH, Bill, OPC email re: attached draft supplemental brief addressing changes to the Settlement Agreement;	Adrian Barnes
03/06/2023	1.2		

Case 1:16-cv-01730-SKO Document 88-5 Filed 07/14/23 Page 3 of 3

03/07/2023	0.1	AB send Bill email re: agreeable to opc's edits re Plaintiff's Revised Motion for Preliminary Approval; request permission to sign+ file;	Adrian Barnes
03/07/2023	0.1	AB read Bill email re: sign + file Plaintiff's Revised Motion for Preliminary Approval;	Adrian Barnes
03/07/2023	0.1	AB send AC email re: attached supplemental brief and Exhibit;	Adrian Barnes
03/21/2023	0.1	AB read Bill email re: contacting proposed administrator re preliminary approval;	Adrian Barnes
03/22/2023	0.1	AB read co-counsel email re: draft Fees Motion; attached template; Notice period;	Adrian Barnes
03/22/2023	0.1	AB send AC email re: Tracking Notice period;	Adrian Barnes
03/23/2023	0.1	AB read AC email re: Notice mailing and Response deadlines;	Adrian Barnes
03/28/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: Preparing a timeline for review and approval;	Adrian Barnes
03/30/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: draft of the Project Timeline for review and approval; confirm sending CAFA notice;	Adrian Barnes
04/10/2023	0.3	AB read x6 Craig, OPC, Atticus email re: CAFA notices and data update;	Adrian Barnes
04/11/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: attached Notice for review and approval;	Adrian Barnes
04/18/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: Finalizing notice for approval;	Adrian Barnes
04/18/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: Attached updated notice for approval;	Adrian Barnes
04/20/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: attached finalized notice;	Adrian Barnes
04/24/2023	0.1	AB read OPC email re: attached Proposed Order Granting Defendant's Unopposed Ex Parte Application;	Adrian Barnes
04/27/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: Updated timeline;	Adrian Barnes
05/05/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus, Craig email re: Claim Form Question;	Adrian Barnes
05/16/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: attached final notice that will be sent to class members on Friday May 26th;	Adrian Barnes
06/07/2023	0.3	AB read x3 OPC, Atticus email re: confirmation re mailed post cards;	Adrian Barnes
06/16/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: attached Project Status Report;	Adrian Barnes
06/21/2023	0.2	AB read x2 OPC, Atticus email re: Class member's claim form;	Adrian Barnes
06/23/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: attached Project Status Report;	Adrian Barnes
06/27/2023	0.3	AB read x3 co-counsel email re: call with Mrs. Smith re her deceased husband; process Errol Pingue claim form and call Juan Homero re same	Adrian Barnes
07/05/2023	0.1	AB read Atticus email re: Attached Project Status Report;	Adrian Barnes
07/10/2023	4.6	Draft motion for attorneys' fees and costs and supporting declaration of Julian Hammond	Adrian Barnes
07/10/2023	0.4	AB email x4 with co-counsel re: drafting the fees motion and a supporting declaration for Craig; due date	Adrian Barnes
07/10/2023	0.1	AB read AC email re: attached Stipulation of Class and PAGA Representative Action Settlement and Release and Order Granting Hearing and Granting Preliminary Approval;	Adrian Barnes
07/11/2023	3.6	Draft motion for attorneys' fees and costs and supporting declaration of Julian Hammond	Adrian Barnes
07/11/2023	0.2	AB read x2 co-counsel email re: attached reports showing their firm's costs and lodestar; attached draft of Craig's motion in support of the fees motion	Adrian Barnes